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(Our Lady is here.  She’s dressed all in white, a white veil, a white gown, with gold trim along 
the veil.  There is a star at the bottom of her dress, and she’s on a cloud.  She says,) 
 
I am Our Lady of the Rosary.  Praised be Jesus! 
 
My dear children, 
Today I come from Heaven with an urgent plea.  This urgent plea is for all mankind and the 
world to return to God.  Little children, you’re living in sin, and many cities also are living in 
grave sin which is offending my Son, your Lord and our Savior Jesus Christ.  Little children, you 
must pray and make many more sacrifices.  I’ve warned you, and I continue to warn you of great 
danger which is impending.   
 
Pray!  Pray!  Pray for an alleviation of God’s justice!  Sacrifice yourselves for the conversion of 
sinners.  Little children, you do not understand what awaits you in the next life.  Hell is very real 
and many souls continue to be lost.  Please, pray and return to God!  Please, dear children, you 
must stop offending God!  If you do not, you will suffer.  There will be famines, droughts, 
hurricanes, earthquakes, tornadoes, and natural disasters of every kind will grip your nation and 
the world if it does not pray and return to God.  The possibility of a great chastisement from God 
is possible.  Without alleviation of his justice, this will happen.  
 
Pray, dear children, and amend your ways.  I love you and I bless you, in name of the Father, and 
of the Son, and of the Holy Spirit, Amen.  And now, for my final message. 
 
 
Praised be Jesus! 
Dear children, 
Today, like never before do I invite you to pray the Rosary for peace.  Pray the Rosary for inner 
peace which you need now more than ever.  Pray that the Holy Spirit may come upon you and 
enlighten your mind and your heart so that you may know what to do and how to pray.   
 
Little children, I am for you for conversion. (She’s holding up her Rosary.)  Little children, the 
Rosary alone can work miracles.  Consecrate yourselves to me, and pray the Rosary every day. I 
call you to pray the Rosary twice a day because now is the time in which I need your prayers 
most of all.  Little children, Satan is very real, and he’s actively trying to threaten my plans.  
Pray that all that God desires to give to your heart may be accomplished without interference 
from the evil one.   
 
Little children, when you pray, you open your hearts to God, and God graces you with many 
graces and virtues.  This allows you, little children, to become my little angels.  Never cease 
praying, and realize that I am with you.  No one loves you the way my Son does.  He has 
sacrificed himself for love of you, and I as your mother have come because I love you and I wish 
you all to be with me in Heaven one day in the glory of God.  Therefore, here is what I say to 



you.  Pray two Rosaries a day and know that I am with you.  I love you, and I take your petitions 
into my heart, and I will present them to my Son Jesus.  I give you my blessing, my motherly 
blessing of love, peace, and joy, in the name of the Father, and of the Son, and of the Holy Spirit, 
Amen.  Thank you for responding to my call.  Go, my dear little angels, in the great peace, love, 
and mercy of God Most High.  
 
Copying and distribution of this message is permitted and encouraged as long as nothing is changed, added, or 
deleted.  Other messages of God the Father, Jesus, and Mary may be read at www.movingheartfoundation.com 
 


