
Message from ST. JOSEPH 
To THE WORLD 
September 2, 2008 through Chris Courtis, a visionary in Maryland, U.S.A. 
 
(St Joseph is here, and he’s making a descent.  He wants me to describe what he looks like and 
what he’s wearing.  Again, he has dark, black hair.  There’s a little grey around the top of his 
hair near his forehead, a little grey.  His hair is wavy and parted and it curls.  He’s dark 
skinned, Mediterranean looking.  His eyes are transparent and he has a well-trimmed beard, not 
thick.  He’s dressed in a white gown with long sleeves.  It comes down to the cloud that he’s on.  
He has a gold clip with a green sash that flows all the way down to the end of his long gown at 
the bottom of the cloud.  He has two gold clips on his shoulders and they support a long, 
extremely white cape) that flows to the knee, and he’s all bathed in light.  Now he says,) 
 
My dear little ones, give praise and glory be to the Father, and to the Son, and to the Holy Spirit 
who has allowed me to be here with you in this ever special way. 
 
My little ones, 
Always, I come in the name of God - the Father, the Son, and the Holy Spirit.  I come in the 
name of God the Father, Jesus the Son, and in the Living Spirit, the Living Holy Spirit which is 
the third person of the Holy Trinity.  I ask you to give honor to the Holy Spirit, to always have 
Him on your mind and heart because He is the one who gives to you inspirations, graces, and 
love.  I desire you to know how real the Holy Spirit is and the presence He desires to be in your 
life.  You all have received Him through the grace of Holy Baptism.  Do not reject His holy 
inspirations.  If you reject His holy inspirations, you reject the Holy Trinity and you deny the 
third person of the Holy Trinity who is God.  If the inspiration comes from God, it will last and 
God will open doors.  If not, the inspiration will fade, and you will know that it has not been 
God’s will or from the Holy Spirit.   
 
You ask me why do I touch on this point, little ones.  It is because God has given to each one of 
you in abundance, the Holy Spirit as a guide and as a giver of gifts and inspirations.  I ask you 
today to pray to the Holy Spirit to enlighten you and to guide you in your thoughts and your 
inspirations.  God truly desires to use each and every one of you if you will allow and if you will 
let Him.  Open you heart to the Holy Spirit this day and you will be renewed in abundance. Pray, 
pray, pray to the Holy Spirit for enlightenment, guidance and inspiration, and then do as Our 
Lady has always asked you to do – “Do whatever He tells you to do.”   
 
I touch on this point because (He’s smiling.) because I desire a painting of My Most Chaste 
Heart to be done so that all may come before the image of my Most Chaste Heart and receive 
abundant graces and mercy.  I desire this to be done so that it may foster the devotion to my 
Most Chaste Heart.  This is my request, and I ask that it be completed as soon as possible so that 
as soon as possible this devotion may reach other souls in need of my protection, my grace, and 
my love.   
 
Little ones, I bless you and I take your petitions into my Most Chaste Heart, and I will present 
them to the Immaculate Heart of your most holy mother, and I will present your petitions also to 
the throne of God and to the Holy Spirit who enlightens you and who inspires you so that this 



devotion may have it’s complete fulfillment in this decade.  I bless you, little ones, in the name 
of the Father, and of the Son, and of the Holy Spirit, Amen.  Thank you,  Now go, my little ones 
in the great peace of God. 
 
Copying and distribution of this message is permitted and encouraged as long as nothing is changed, added, or 
deleted.  Other messages may be read at www.movingheartfoundation.com  
 


