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My dear and beloved children of My Father’s earth,
I come today to invite you and to call you back to the love which burns within My Most Sacred Heart. I 
want you all to realize that I am with you. Even though you do not see Me, I am with you. I see and 
know everything. I know that you all suffer in this world and I know your heartaches and your pains, 
and I want to comfort you and to give you joy and peace, but first, you must surrender yourselves to Me 
and let Me fill you with My peace and with My love.

There is no greater love in the world than this, that a man lays down His life for his friends and for those 
He loves. Each and every one of you are My children, are My Father’s children, and there is a plan and 
a destiny all your own. You are called to be the children of light and to spread peace throughout the 
world. I call you to spread peace through your little, everyday, ordinary tasks. It is in your littleness, 
your simplicity, and your humbleness that I can act through you. It is through your littleness that you 
receive all My power and all My glory. I know, My dear ones, that the world does not value these little 
virtues and that it hates littleness and meekness. The world seeks to be proud and pushy.

But you, My little ones, should act differently. In accordance with the Divine Will of God, I call you to 
littleness, simplicity, and child-like, great love. In order to receive these virtues and to practice in all 
humility, I call you to surrender yourselves to Me and to ask. Ask Me and I will give you the virtues 
that you seek. However, for many, you will be tested. I test you in order to prove that you are worthy of 
these virtues and graces. A flower cannot bloom without proper moisture and without the proper soil. 
You, My little ones, in the same way, cannot hope to grow in littleness and humility without being 
tested. Whatever you lack, I will make up. 

Satan seeks to deceive the world by manipulating. He schools and fools people into believing that the 
higher power that they seek is themselves. I call you to be submissive to Me and My Father and to 
practice humility with great love. If you learn nothing this Lenten season, learn this one. Learn this 
lesson. Let My words penetrate your heart. If you do not seek to be humble before Me and little in this 
life, you will never, never, never, enter into My glory. The key to your littleness is a door that opens up 
to the Eucharist, for My glory and mercy is unveiled. Unfortunately, too many people are distant.
Humility in great love, humility in great love, humility - in - great - love! Learn it! Practice it! Cherish 
it! Then everything you do will become a living sacrifice offered to Me.

I bless you, My dear ones, with the Sign of the Cross which is the sign of your redemption. In the name 
of the Father, and of the Son, and of the Holy Spirit. Also, today I bless you with abundant graces.
Now you are not aware of them, but when you leave here and throughout this month, you will become 
aware of what I have blessed you with. I am joyful, as My mother is joyful, to see you here. Bless you, 
My little ones, bless you. Go in My peace. 
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